



by 1.21 produces a result of \$182.22. Therefore, the hourly rate adjusted for inflation, rounded down, is currently \$182.

4. Based on an hourly rate of \$182 for 51.7 hours, the Liermans are requesting an award of \$9,409.40 for all attorney time spent on this matter.

5. This affidavit is submitted in support of the Liermans' motion for costs and attorney fees under Wis. Stat. § 814.245(3).

Dated at Wauwatosa, Wisconsin this 30th day of May, 2012.

  
\_\_\_\_\_  
ANNE L. De LEO

Subscribed and sworn to before me  
this 30th day of May, 2012.

  
PATRICIA J.  
NELSON

Notary Public, State of Wisconsin.  
My commission is permanent.

NELSON, IRVINGS & WAEFFLER, S.C.  
2675 North Mayfair Road, Suite 420  
Wauwatosa, Wisconsin 53226  
(414) 777-0220  
FAX: (414) 777-0140

Brian Lierman  
c/o Barbara Lierman  
3729 East Mallory Avenue  
Cudahy WI 53110

Page: 1  
06/01/2012  
File No: 4079-00H  
Statement No: 12

Civil - Miscellaneous

Fees

			Hours	
11/09/2010	PJN	Telephone conference with Erin; Review documents; E-mail to DRW.	0.80	220.00
11/17/2010	PJN	Telephone conference with client; Review issues.	0.30	82.50
11/18/2010	PJN	Research legal issues.	0.70	192.50
11/19/2010	CJW	E-mail re: research on Ch. 227.	0.20	55.00
11/22/2010	ADL	Conference with client.	1.00	275.00
	PJN	Conference with client.	1.00	275.00
	PJN	Draft affidavit; Review statutes.	2.00	550.00
	ADL	Review draft affidavit.	0.30	82.50
11/23/2010	ADL	Draft and prepare third draft of Affidavit and e-mail to Barbara.	0.10	27.50
	ADL	Draft and prepare retainer letter.	0.10	N/C
	ADL	Research standards for reopening judgment.	0.60	165.00
11/24/2010	ADL	Final draft of affidavit.	0.10	27.50
	ADL	Research and review statutes re: service by mail.	0.10	27.50
11/29/2010	ADL	Review affidavit and make final changes.	0.10	27.50
	PJN	Final draft of Affidavit; Brief conference with client in office.	0.80	N/C

Civil - Miscellaneous

			Hours	
12/01/2010	ADL	Research.	0.40	110.00
	ADL	Draft and prepare Motion.	0.30	82.50
12/03/2010	ADL	Final draft of motion.	0.20	55.00
	ADL	Draft and prepare letter and fax to Jorgensen & Hunter.	0.10	27.50
12/08/2010	ADL	Telephone conference with John Jorgensen.	0.20	55.00
	ADL	Draft and prepare letter to Judge Cooper.	0.30	82.50
12/09/2010	ADL	File motion to reopen.	1.00	275.00
12/13/2010	PJN	Office conference with Anne.	0.40	110.00
	ADL	Office conference with Pat.	0.40	110.00
12/14/2010	ADL	Telephone conference with Barbara re: attending next week's motion hearing.	0.20	55.00
12/19/2010	ADL	Research cases regarding motions to re-open and Chapter 227 and prepare for argument.	1.20	330.00
12/20/2010	ADL	Final preparation for argument.	1.00	275.00
12/21/2010	ADL	Argument on Motion.	1.00	275.00
12/23/2010	ADL	Draft and prepare e-mails to Disability Rights Wisconsin.	0.20	55.00
	PJN	Review e-mail to DRW.	0.10	N/C
12/27/2010	ADL	Draft and prepare Order after 12/21 hearing.	0.30	82.50
12/28/2010	ADL	Final draft of order.	0.20	55.00
01/06/2011	ADL	Conference with DRW attorneys re: the motion to reopen.	1.00	N/C
01/07/2011	ADL	Conference with Pat to discuss outline for brief.	0.10	27.50
01/18/2011	ADL	Research and draft brief.	1.50	412.50
01/20/2011	ADL	Research and drafting of brief in support of motion.	3.00	825.00
01/21/2011	ADL	Draft and prepare brief in support of motion.	0.20	55.00
01/25/2011	ADL	Draft and prepare Brief in Support of Motion.	2.00	550.00

Civil - Miscellaneous

		Hours	
01/30/2011	ADL Work on final draft - adding section on probability of success.	1.50	412.50
01/31/2011	ADL Final draft of brief.	0.80	220.00
02/23/2011	ADL Review brief submitted by Milwaukee Family Care program.	0.20	55.00
02/26/2011	ADL Draft and prepare reply brief.	2.00	550.00
02/28/2011	ADL Draft and prepare final draft Reply Brief.	0.50	137.50
03/01/2011	ADL Telephone conference with Barbara re: status and March 21 hearing.	0.30	82.50
03/20/2011	ADL Prepare for motion argument.	2.50	687.50
03/21/2011	ADL Appeared in court for motion.	1.00	275.00
03/23/2011	ADL Draft and prepare Order re: 3/21/11 hearing.	0.50	137.50
04/19/2011	ADL Review file; Conversation with attorney at Disability Rights Wisconsin; E-mail to John Jorgensen; Conversation with Barbara.	1.00	275.00
	ADL Research recovery of benefits paid when a fair hearing has been requested.	0.40	110.00
	ADL Telephone conference with John Jorgensen re: next steps and paying continuing benefits.	0.30	82.50
04/26/2011	ADL Telephone status conference with Judge Cooper and John Jorgensen; Earlier conversation with John Jorgensen.	0.30	82.50
	ADL Draft order remanding case for new fair hearing.	0.30	82.50
05/03/2011	ADL Final draft of Remand Order and cover letter.	0.20	55.00
06/20/2011	ADL Telephone conference with Barbara; E-mail to John Jorgensen re: status of order remanding case.	0.10	27.50
11/10/2011	ADL Scheduling conference with Administrative Law Judge (Brian Schneider).	0.20	55.00
	ADL Telephone conference with Barb re: status and fair hearing scheduled.	0.20	55.00
11/30/2011	ADL Telephone conference with John Jorgensen.	0.10	27.50

Civil - Miscellaneous

		Hours	
	ADL Draft and prepare letter to J. Jorgensen.	0.20	55.00
12/21/2011	ADL Draft and prepare e-mail to Milwaukee County Department of Family Care re: reviewing Brian's file.	0.20	55.00
01/13/2012	ADL Review file at Family Care office.	1.50	412.50
01/19/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barbara re: Brian in hospital.	0.20	55.00
02/07/2012	ADL Draft and prepare letter to Jeaneen Dehring.	0.20	55.00
02/13/2012	ADL Telephone call from Jeaneen Dehring; Sent copy of October 26 Order.	0.20	55.00
02/16/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barb to discuss hearing in March.	0.20	55.00
03/14/2012	ADL Conference with Barbara in office to prepare for hearing.	1.50	412.50
	ADL Telephone conference with J. Dehring.	0.30	82.50
03/15/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Jim Hennen.	0.50	137.50
03/16/2012	ADL Second conversation with Hennen.	0.20	55.00
	ADL Telephone conference with Barb.	0.30	82.50
	ADL Second telephone conference with Barb.	0.20	55.00
	ADL Telephone conference with Brian Schneider.	0.10	27.50
03/19/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barb.	0.50	137.50
03/22/2012	ADL Letter to Jim Hennen at Milwaukee County Department of Family Care.	0.50	137.50
03/23/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Jim Hennen re: new settlement offer.	0.30	82.50
03/27/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barb re: Hennen's offer of settlement.	0.50	137.50
04/13/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barbara re: terms of settlement offer she wants to make.	0.30	82.50
	ADL Draft and prepare letter to Jim Hennen re: settlement.	0.30	82.50
04/19/2012	ADL Telephone conference with Barb - confirming she		

Civil - Miscellaneous

		Hours	
	is aware of hearing on 4/30.	0.10	27.50
04/27/2012	ADL Prepare for 4/30 hearing.	3.00	825.00
04/28/2012	ADL Copy exhibits; Review hearing preparation.	1.50	412.50
04/30/2012	ADL Attend hearing (including travel).	1.00	275.00
05/30/2012	ADL Drafting of motion.	2.50	687.50
05/31/2012	ASM Revisions to motion.	1.00	275.00
06/01/2012	ASM Filing of motion.	0.50	137.50
	For Current Services Rendered	<u>51.70</u>	<u>14,217.50</u>
	Total Non-billable Hours	2.00	

Recapitulation		
<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Partner	50.20	\$13,805.00
Associate	1.50	412.50

Total Current Work 14,217.50

Balance Due \$14,217.50