

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com



Chris Abele
 Milwaukee County Executive
 Milwaukee County Courthouse
 901 N. 9th Street, Room 306
 Milwaukee, WI 53233

Client: 066164

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

EIN 39-0934985

Due Upon Presentation
 Return Upper Portion with Payment

Invoice No. 1184626

For Professional services rendered through January 31, 2012, as follows:

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/11/12	C Palmer	Begin reviewing pleadings and correspondence review TRO issued by Judge Pocan.	7.00	\$2,730.00
		preparation for and meeting with County staff		
1/11/12	D Vaccaro	Review and analyze pleadings filed in TRO filing multiple conferences preliminary review of legal research telephone conference travel from office to courthouse for meeting return travel to office; follow up conference prepare e-mail correspondence	8.70	\$3,393.00
1/12/12	C Palmer	Telephone conference in confer with DL Greathouse regarding Notice of Appearance; legal analysis briefs ; review and analyze review and analyze actions determine and select various documents as exhibits; preparing for arguments for TRO hearing.	6.20	\$2,418.00

IN ACCOUNT WITH



Client: 066164

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com

Page 2

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/12/12	D Vaccaro	Travel to Milwaukee County office for meeting same; interview and assess potential witnesses; return travel to office; meeting draft arguments for hearing; draft chronology; prepare direct examination multiple discussions analyze filing received from Sheriff's counsel review and outline arguments review e-mails analyze various statutes review and	11.00	\$4,290.00
1/12/12	D Greathouse	Draft proposed order for TRO hearing; telephone conference revise proposed order; draft notice of appearance; file notice of appearance and other documents with court; telephone conference various arguments research meeting	8.20	\$1,927.00
1/12/12	D Krajacic	Prepare materials and potentials exhibits prepare Chronology of Significant Events.	5.20	\$780.00

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com



Client: 066164

Page 4

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/13/12	D Vaccaro	Attend hearing		9.50	\$3,705.00
			; follow up meeting		
			begin consideration		
			; review		
			draft correspondence		
			multiple conferences		
			conference call		
			conference		
			review and respond to e-mails		
1/13/12	L Brueggeman	Confer	1 research	5.70	\$855.00
1/13/12	D Greathouse	Attend TRO Hearing; review relevant statutes and research	research	7.20	\$0.00
			confer		
1/14/12	D Greathouse	Conduct legal research		5.40	\$1,269.00
1/14/12	D Vaccaro	Review and analyze preliminary legal research results		1.20	\$468.00

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com



Client: 066164

Page 5

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/14/12	C Palmer	Review		2.10	\$819.00
		review	drafting letter		
		legal analysis	conduct		
		drafting letter			
		drafting list			
1/15/12	D Greathouse	Attend telephone conference		3.50	\$822.50
			research		
1/15/12	D Vaccaro	Telephone conference		5.00	\$1,950.00
			conference		
		research items and response brief to motion to dismiss;			
		continued review and analysis			
		conferences			
		of correspondence			
		review and analyze			
		follow up conferences			
		prepare correspondence			
		review and analyze results of			
1/15/12	M Smith	research		2.00	\$300.00
		Review and analysis			
		participation in telephone conference			
1/15/12	C Palmer	Telephone conference		2.50	\$975.00
		revise letter	draft email		

IN ACCOUNT WITH



100 East Wisconsin Avenue
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
FAX 414.277.0656
Telephone 414.271.6560
michaelbest.com

Client: 066164

Page 6

February 28, 2012
Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/16/12	C Nyenhuis	Conduct research	research	research	4.60	\$0.00
				draft		
1/16/12	D Greathouse	emails Review	review documents review prior cases review statutory authority review draft response brief; review memorandum		3.40	\$799.00
1/16/12	D Vaccaro	Prepare for conference call attend conference call conference follow up conferences review and analyze draft and revise screen memorandum correspondence outline			5.50	\$2,145.00

IN ACCOUNT WITH



Client: 066164

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com

Page 7

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/16/12	C Palmer	Drafting memorandum	7.20	\$2,808.00
		reviewing opinions draft memorandum telephone conference review mandamus elements; review prior cases review order denying motion for temporary restraining order; review and analyze		
1/17/12	C Palmer	Draft and revise brief ; review	9.50	\$3,705.00
		case review Wisconsin constitution draft and revised revise developing legal arguments drafting argument continuing revisions review review telephone conference		
1/17/12	L Brueggeman	Conduct legal research	3.00	\$450.00
1/17/12	M Smith	Further research	3.80	\$570.00
		review case law; redraft argument conferences		

IN ACCOUNT WITH



100 East Wisconsin Avenue
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
FAX 414.277.0656
Telephone 414.271.6560
michaelbest.com

Client: 066164

Page 8

February 28, 2012
Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/17/12	D Vaccaro	Telephone conference to e-mails multiple conferences conference call	review and respond drafting Amended Complaint; revise brief	8.50	\$3,315.00
		conferences	revise		
1/17/12	D Krajacic	Preparation multiple phone conferences		2.70	\$405.00
		prepare email ; prepare ; prepare			
		prepare email			
1/18/12	D Krajacic	Preparation of materials multiple phone conferences		2.40	\$360.00
		revise Affidavit 457; review collate copies conferences collate copies			

IN ACCOUNT WITH



100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com

Client: 066164

Page 9

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/18/12	D Vaccaro	Revise brief conferences	6.70	\$2,613.00
		review and analyze review and respond to e-mails prepare e-mail correspondence telephone conference		
		prepare prepare correspondence conclude filing		
		plan and		
1/18/12	C Palmer	Continue revising brief telephone conference confer	7.40	\$2,886.00
		; review notice of claim requirements and determine next steps for budgetary controls.		
1/19/12	D Vaccaro	Attend questions	2.50	\$975.00
		meeting testify and answer post-hearing conference follow up conferences review correspondence		
1/19/12	D Vaccaro	Travel from office to Milwaukee County Courthouse	2.00	\$0.00
		waiting time return travel		

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com



Client: 066164

Page 10

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/19/12	C Palmer	Continue research revise letter continue to develop strategy conference revise	draft and evaluate	4.50	\$1,755.00
1/19/12	A Fraser	letter Work on Engagement letter details. (No Charge)	outline	0.50	\$0.00
1/20/12	D Vaccaro	Telephone conference conference call revise correspondence	 follow up	3.30	\$1,287.00
1/20/12	C Palmer	conferences continued consideration substitution of party issues and amending complaint. Telephone conference continue revisions to letter continue research and development of claim telephone conference revise letter		4.20	\$1,638.00
1/23/12	C Palmer	Confer analysis telephone conferences conference call brief	preparing telephone call	3.70	\$1,443.00

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
FAX 414.277.0656
Telephone 414.271.6560
michaelbest.com



Client: 066164

Page 11

February 28, 2012
Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/23/12	D Vaccaro	Conference	3.20	\$1,248.00
		review and analyze		
		review and respond to e-mails		
		analyze		
		continued preparations for		
		evidentiary hearing on temporary injunction motion.		
1/24/12	C Palmer	Telephone conference	4.30	\$1,677.00
		draft update memorandum		
		review brief		
		draft, revise and finalize brief		
1/24/12	D Vaccaro	Telephone conference	7.50	\$2,925.00
		conferences		
		travel from office to courthouse		
		witness interviews		
		outline arguments		
		review and analyze pleadings		
		work on direct examinations		
		prepare correspondence		
		additional e-mails		
		review and respond to		

IN ACCOUNT WITH



100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com

Client: 066164

Page 12

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/25/12	C Palmer	Reviewing affidavits. conference	telephone	6.30	\$2,457.00
		revising brief and forward same follow up telephone conference finalize brief in response to review affidavits	continue draft memo		
1/25/12	C Nyenhuis	Research	draft email memorandum research draft email	1.80	\$450.00
1/25/12	D Vaccaro	Conference to e-mails	review and respond conference	8.90	\$3,471.00
		additional e-mails revise response brief	review and analyze case law correspondence review and respond to conference review and draft correspondence outline direct examination outline adverse examination		
1/25/12	D Krajacic	continue preparations for temporary injunction hearing. Multiple phone conferences		0.50	\$75.00
		review image and collate copies	prepare materials		

IN ACCOUNT WITH



Client: 066164

188 East Wisconsin Avenue
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
FAX 414.277.0656
Telephone 414.271.6560
michaelbest.com

Page 13

February 28, 2012
Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/25/12	T Janczewski	Conference	0.60	\$0.00
1/25/12	T Janczewski	Conduct legal research and analysis	0.40	\$100.00
1/26/12	D Vaccaro	Telephone conference	9.70	\$3,783.00
		telephone conferences		
		telephone conference		
		draft and revise		
		respond to		
	e-mails	telephone conference		
		draft and revise		
	prepare e-mail correspondence	review and		
	analyze	conference		
	revise and finalize arguments	follow up conferences		
	analyze reply brief	review and		
	review and analyze answer	review and		
	analyze case law			
	draft correspondence			
	correspondence			

IN ACCOUNT WITH



188 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com

Client: 066164

Page 14

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/26/12	C Palmer	Telephone conference	review	5.10	\$1,989.00
			analyze multiple cases		
		cited therein; meeting			
		review draft affidavit			
1/26/12	L Brueggeman	Confer		1.30	\$195.00
1/27/12	C Palmer	Continue reading cases	prepare for arguments	6.40	\$2,496.00
			prepare outline		
1/27/12	T Janczewski	Research and analysis	draft	1.20	\$300.00
		summary			
1/27/12	T Janczewski	Attend hearing on motion to dismiss temporary injunction and motion to intervene. (No Charge)		4.50	\$0.00
1/27/12	D Vaccaro	Final preparations for hearing on motion to dismiss, motion to intervene and temporary injunction; travel from office	attend	6.70	\$2,613.00
			present arguments and testimony;		
		follow up conference			
		return travel			
1/27/12	L Brueggeman	Confer	update research	1.40	\$210.00
1/30/12	D Vaccaro	organize file materials.			
		Review and respond to e-mails		0.90	\$0.00
		draft summary			

IN ACCOUNT WITH

100 East Wisconsin Avenue
 Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
 FAX 414.277.0656
 Telephone 414.271.6560
 michaelbest.com



Client: 066164

Page 15

February 28, 2012
 Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

1/30/12	D Vaccaro	Review correspondence prepare e-mails conference conference call	1.40	\$546.00
1/30/12	C Palmer	transcript Drafting several telephone conferences review and analyze	2.40	\$936.00
1/31/12	D Vaccaro	review transcript determine next steps and strategy. Review and analyze decision conference conference call	2.00	\$780.00
1/31/12	C Palmer	Review Arbitrator Raleigh Jones' decision and determine impact : telephone conference extended conference	2.10	\$819.00

Total Hours 263.70

Total Services \$84,552.50

Disbursements:

IN ACCOUNT WITH



Client: 066164

166 East Wisconsin Avenue
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53202-4108
FAX 414.277.0656
Telephone 414.271.6560
michaelbest.com

Page 16

February 28, 2012
Invoice No. 1184626

Matter: 066164-0003 Legal Services - Milwaukee County

01/12/2012	Parking - Daniel J Vaccaro Daniel J Vaccaro - Parking for court appearances	20.00
01/13/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	448.52
01/16/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	30.22
01/17/2012	Partial Transcript of 01/13/2012 Proceedings - Irene Koenigs	135.00
01/18/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	27.57
01/19/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	35.06
01/23/2012	Parking - Daniel J Vaccaro Daniel J Vaccaro - Parking for Milwaukee County vs. Sheriff Clark	11.00
01/24/2012	Parking - Daniel J Vaccaro Daniel J Vaccaro - Parking for hearings at Milwaukee County Courthouse	22.00
01/25/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	54.32
01/26/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	10.96
01/26/2012	Lexis - Legal Research	79.07
01/30/2012	Travel, Lodging & Meals - Charles B. Palmer Parking and mileage to MKE to prep for hearing	194.96

Disbursements Total \$1,068.68

Total This Matter **\$85,621.18**